
 

 

 

 

 

Get in touch.......         Notices: desboroughstgiles@gmail.com 
  

Rev Hannah Jeffery Rev Neil Clarke 

Email: revhj@outlook.com Email: revnclarke@aol.com 

Phone: 01536 506299 Phone: 01536 760667 
  

Rev Martin Swan Wardens & Stewards 
Email: martin.chelseafan1@gmail.com Pauline Clarke Steve Burt 

 Martin Lawrence Peter Shuker 
 Ann Window Carolyn Rice 

Administrator: Wendy East 01536 506299 (Tues am) 
Safeguarding officer: Pauline Clarke 760667 
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St Giles Church 
Desborough 

A community rooted in Christ, sharing God's love with all 

WELCOME 
 

Sunday 26th May 2019 
 

This Week at St Giles........ 
    

Sunday 26th May 8.30 am Holy Communion 
 9.30 am Mini Church 
 10.00 am Holy Communion 
 6.00 pm Evensong 

  

Monday 27th May 9.30 am A Team 
 7.30 pm Bellringing 

  

Tuesday 28th May 9.15 am Morning Prayer 
 10.00 am Wellbeing  cafe 
   

Wednesday 29th May 10.00 am Holy Communion 
 2.00 pm Ladies Fellowship 
   

Friday 31st May 2.00 pm Magazine Collating 
   

Saturday 1st June 10.00 am Open Church 
   

Sunday 2nd June 8.30 am Holy Communion 
 10.00 am Confirmation Service 
 6.00 pm Link Up 



Service changes 23rd June Please note that 
the 8.30am communion service will move to 
the Community Centre on this day. 
The 10am service will take place 
at 9.30am and will be a combined service 
with the Mini Church congregation. 
The Church Council agreed some time ago 
that once a year we would join in with Mini 
Church and rather than always expecting 
them to change times, we would meet at 
their usual time. The service will be run by 
the Mini Church team, but it will include 
Holy Communion at the end for all those 
who wish to stay. There will be a short break 
between the two to allow for those who do 
not wish to stay for communion. 

 
Photos from the last 50 years! If you have 
any photos from the last 50 years at St Giles 
we’d love to see them! We’re hoping to put 
together a display of the life of St Giles for 
our 50th anniversary as an 
Anglican/Methodist Partnership, which we 
will be celebrating on the first weekend in 
October (more details to follow). Please 
place any photos (or copies of) in an 
envelope marked 50th anniversary and post 
through the CC letter box asap. If you are 
giving an original and would therefore like it 
back, please be sure to include a note so we 
know who to return the photo(s) to. 
 

!News from the Pews! 

Thy Kingdom Come events 
Do you want to see God’s Kingdom Come in 

Desborough and beyond?  
Then come and be part of praying for it! 

  

Monday June 3rd 7.30-8.30pm Rothwell 
Parish Church (come at 7pm if you’d like 
refreshments first). A time of creative prayer 
and worship from churches across the wider 
Kettering area, please come and represent 
Desborough and be part of praying together 
 

Tuesday June 4th 9.15-10.15am at Revive 
Extra our monthly church prayer meeting 
but we hope to be joined by the other 
churches in the town too. We’ll be praying 
specifically for Desborough and those who 
are able will be going out into the town, 
those aren’t will stay to pray. If you’ve never 
done prayer walking before it’s a wonderful 
way to connect with what God is doing. As 
always- no pressure to pray out loud! 
 

Sunday June 9th June 4-5pm at the URC in 
Desborough an all age service of prayer and 
celebration for Thy Kingdom Come. Please 
come and be part of this united service – a 
big focus for Thy Kingdom Come is unity and 
all the churches in the town are joining 
together for this event. If you really can’t 
manage two services in one day, then 
prioritise this one! Refreshments included. 

A big thank you to all those who helped at 
The Big brekkie and to everyone who 
supported us.  We raised £246 at the 
breakfast and £37 from the collection at 
Baskets and Barrows. So well done! 
Carolyn Rice. 

 

Revive Coffee Shop needs more volunteers. 
Please pray about this and if you feel God is 
calling you to join the team, then call in for a 
chat with one of the managers (Vicki, Julie or 
Kim) to see how you can join this important 
mission in our community. Thank you 

 
Next Sunday (2nd June at 10.00 am) we 
welcome Bishop John Holbrook for our 

confirmation service at St Giles. Please keep 
the 4 candidates in your prayers this week in 

the lead up to the service. 
 

Will Pearce 
Roy Perry 

Stuart Randle 
Laurabeth Creasy 

Joanne Grove 
Martin Fage 

 

Please stay after the service for celebratory 
refreshments! Please bring cake! 

 
St Giles is part of the Inclusive Church 

Network 
 


